

Richard Cairns
Executive Director of Regeneration,
Environment & Growth



Our Ref: FOI -18/1906497

Your Ref:

Date: 25 April 2018

raymond.luke@confused.com

Council Offices
Garshake Road
Dumbarton
G82 3PU

Tel: (01389) 737000

Dear Mr Luke,

Freedom of Information Request

Information Requested

- a) The combined total number of speed humps, bumps, cushions and tables currently installed in your local authority area
- b) The height of the largest speed hump, bump, cushion or table installed in your local authority area
- c) The height of the smallest speed hump, bump, cushion or table installed in your local authority area
- d) The amount of compensation paid out by your local authority to drivers for damage to cars caused by speed humps, bumps, cushions or tables, broken down by year for 2015, 2016, 2017 and 2018 to date.
- e) Does your local authority have any plans to remove any speed humps, bumps, cushions or tables in your area?

Response

Our answers to your questions are as follows –

- a) West Dunbartonshire Council have checked our records and we hold no recorded information relating to this question.
- b) 100mm.
- c) West Dunbartonshire Council have checked our records and we hold no recorded information relating to this question.
- d) West Dunbartonshire Council have checked our records and we hold no recorded information relating to this question.
- e) No.

This information has been disclosed in terms of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Information disclosed to you may be subject to copyright laws. By providing this information West Dunbartonshire Council does not waive copyright nor does it create or provide a right to publish, disclose, reproduce, re-use or alter this information without consent of those parties holding the copyright.

Review Procedure

If you are dissatisfied with this decision or the way in which West Dunbartonshire Council has dealt with your request, you are entitled to require the Council to review its decision. Please note that in order for a review to take place, you must:

- lodge a written “requirement for review” within 40 working days of the date of this notice
- include your address for correspondence, a description of the original request and the reasons why you are dissatisfied
- Send your review request to the following address:

FOI Review
Regulatory Services
West Dunbartonshire Council
Council Offices
Garshake Road
Dumbarton
G82 3PU
Email: foi@west-dunbarton.gov.uk

Staff not involved in the original decision will handle the review. You will receive notice of the result of your review within 20 working days. It will explain the findings of the review as well as details of how to appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner if you are dissatisfied with the review decision reached by West Dunbartonshire Council.

Their contact details are as follows:-

The Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner
Kinburn Castle
Doubledykes Road
St Andrews
Fife
KY16 9DS

Email: enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info
Tel: (01334) 464610
Website: www.itspublicknowledge.info/Appeal.

If you have any further queries about this process, please contact me at the telephone number below.

Stephen Wight
Freedom of Information Officer
01389 737227